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Reflection: Set aside regular 
time for introspection and 
reflection. Ask yourself 
thought-provoking questions 
about your values, beliefs, 
emotions, and behaviors. 
Journaling can be an effective 
tool to explore your thoughts 
and experiences. 
 
Mindfulness: Practice being 
fully present in the moment, 
observing your thoughts, 
feelings, and bodily 
sensations without judgment. 
Mindfulness meditation can 
help cultivate this awareness 
and improve your ability to 
understand yourself. 
 
Seek feedback: Actively seek 
feedback from trusted 
individuals who can provide 
honest and constructive 
insights about your strengths 
and areas for improvement. 
Consider their perspectives 
and use them as 
opportunities for self-
reflection. 
 
Emotional intelligence: 
Develop emotional 
intelligence by paying 
attention to your emotions 
and understanding how they 
influence your thoughts and 
actions. Learn to recognize 
and manage your emotions 
effectively, as well as 

empathize with others. 
Values and priorities: Clarify 
your values and priorities to 
align your actions with what 
truly matters to you. 
Understanding your core 
values will help you make 
choices that are in harmony 
with your authentic self. 
 
Embrace imperfections: 
Acknowledge that nobody is 
perfect and that making 
mistakes is a part of life. 
Embrace your imperfections 
and view them as 
opportunities for growth and 
learning. 

 
Self-acceptance: Practice self-
acceptance by cultivating self-
compassion and treating 
yourself with kindness and 
understanding. Embrace your 
strengths and weaknesses, 
knowing that they make you 
unique. 
 
Surround yourself wisely: 

with individuals who support 
and challenge you to grow. 
Engage in meaningful 
conversations and diverse 
perspectives that broaden 
your understanding of 
yourself and the world. 
 
Continuous learning: Commit 
to lifelong learning and 
personal development. Read 
books, attend workshops, and 
engage in activities that 
expand your knowledge and 
expose you to new ideas. 
Take action: Self-awareness is 
only valuable when it leads to 
action. Apply your insights to 
make intentional choices and 
take steps towards personal 
growth and the achievement 
of your goals. 
 
Remember, self-awareness is 
a journey, and it requires 
patience, commitment, and a 
willingness to explore the 
depths of your being. 
Embrace the process and 
enjoy the transformative 
power it can bring to your 
life. 

 
 

Contact your EAP at  
1-877-747-1200 


